
Vendor Price Per Vehicle (DIESEL) Option 1 - Dumpbody Option 2 - Flat Bed Option 3 - Strobe Safety 
Lighting

Total Price for Gas with 
Dump Bed and Safety 

Lighting

Total Price for Gas with 
Flat Bed and Safety Strobe 

Lighting

Tota Price for Diesel with 
Dump Bed and Safety 

Lighting

Total Price for Diesel with 
Flat Bed and Safety 

Lighting
Comments

Howard Bentley GMC Inc 
Albertville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Landers McLarty DCJR     
Huntsville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Donohoo Chevrolet                                      
Ft. Payne, AL $62,436.50 $14,995.00 $8,995.00 $2,201.56 $70,643.06 $64,643.06 $79,633.06 $73,633.06

Guntersville Chevrolet     
Guntersville, AL $59,899.44 No Bid $8,700.00 $1,995.00 No Bid $61,694.00 No Bid $70,594.44

Mitch Smith Chevrolet                 
Cullman, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CDJR of Albertville Inc.         
Albertville, AL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Awarded: 3/11/2026

Vendor Price Per Vehicle (DIESEL) Option 1 - Dumpbody Option 2 - Flat Bed Option 3 - Strobe Safety 
Lighting

Total Price for Gas with 
Dump Bed and Safety 

Lighting

Total Price for Gas with 
Flat Bed and Safety Strobe 

Lighting

Tota Price for Diesel with 
Dump Bed and Safety 

Lighting

Total Price for Diesel with 
Flat Bed and Safety 

Lighting
Comments

Woody Anderson Ford         
Huntsville, AL $66,215.98 $15,614.00 $7,800.00 $1,175.00 $73,705.86 $83,004.98 $83,004.98 $75,190.98

2026 Ford F-350; Dump Bed 
is a Rugby Eliminator

McSweeney Auto Group         
Clanton, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Chevrolet of Boaz                         
Boaz, AL $68,463.50 No Bid Included in Bid Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Price Includes Option 2

Gilbert & Baugh Ford        
Albertville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Alexander Ford                        
Boaz, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cullman Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram                                  
Cullman, AL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sand Mountain Toyota       
Albertville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Awarded: 3/11/2023

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Price per Vehicle (GAS)

$56,916.86

$50,999.00

No Bid

No Bid

Price per Vehicle (GAS)

No Bid

No Bid

$53,446.50

No Bid

      BID OPENING DATE:   2:00 PM   MARCH 3, 2026

 MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION 
424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE  AL  35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #33-25
FOR ONE OR MORE NEW 2026 NEW CHEVROLET  SILVERADO 3500 HD CREW CAB TRUCK(S) OR EQUIVALENT                                                                             
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